REPORT

Public Works and Operations

TO: Mayor and Members of Council

FROM: Lukas Gillham, Operations and Capital Project Technologist
DATE: August 8, 2022

REPORT: PWO-50/22 FILE NO.

SUBJECT: Tender U22-28 Snow Removal from Municipal Parking Lots

BACKGROUND: Tender U22-28 for Snow Removal from Municipal Parking Lots

closed on July 28, 2022.

DISCUSSION: The results were as follows:

Tri Son Contracting Inc.

Section A - $20,114.00 incl. HST
Section B - $31,753.00 incl. HST
Section C — No Bid
Section D - No Bid

Forest Ridge Landscaping Inc.

Section A - $39,069.47 incl. HST
Section B - $39,889.00 incl. HST
Section C - $91,213.60 incl. HST
Section D - $93,112.00 incl. HST

Montgomery MacEwen Contracting
Limited

Section A - $167,805.00 incl. HST
Section B - $116,390.00 incl. HST
Section C - $220,350.00 incl. HST
Section D - $181,139.00 incl. HST




Section A - $103,960.00 incl. HST
Section B - $154,019.00 incl. HST
Section C - $194,247.00 incl. HST
Section D - $115,599.00 incl. HST

Dufferin Construction Company Inc.

Section A - $179,615.76 incl. HST
Section B - $209,551.72 incl. HST
Section C - No Bid
Section D - No Bid

Royalcrest Paving & Contracting Ltd.

Section A - $93,733.50 incl. HST
Section B - $83,648.25 incl. HST
Section C - $149,672.70 incl. HST
Section D - $115,270.60 incl. HST

Marquis Snow & Ice Ltd.

This represents a 38% increase over 2021 prices.
RECOMMENDATION

THAT Report PWO-50/22 of Lukas Gillham, Operations and Capital Project
Technologist be received for information;

AND THAT Council award section A and B to Tri Son Contracting Inc. and section C
and D to Forest Ridge Landscaping Inc. Both contractors have provided the
Township with acceptable snow removal service in the past.

Respectfully Submitted by:

Lukas Gillham, C.E.T.
Operations and Capital Project Technologist



